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Prof Ng is a professor and Deputy Head 
(Administration) at NUS’s Department of Civil 
and Environmental Engineering, as well as 
Director of the Sembcorp-NUS Corporate 
Laboratory. He has over 20 years of experience  
in biological wastewater treatment and 
membrane processes for water reuse and 
seawater desalination, and has served as a 
consultant on municipal wastewater treatment  
and reuse, industrial effluent treatment and 
seawater desalination in Singapore, China, 
Japan and the USA. Prof Ng is also a fellow  
of the International Water Association (IWA) 
and a member of the Management 
Committee of the IWA Specialist Group on 
Membrane Technology.

Formerly Singapore’s Chief Defence Scientist, 
Prof Lui has several decades’ experience in 
engineering, science and research. He is an 
advisor to Singapore’s National Research 
Foundation and various government 
organisations, chairs the Environment &  
Water Industry Development Council’s  
project evaluation panel and sits on the  
boards of research institutes, corporations  
and technical organisations, including the 
Executive Committee for Environmental  
and Water Technologies.

Prof Lui is a professor at NUS, a fellow of the 
Singapore Academy of Engineering and the 
Singapore National Academy of Sciences and 
an honorary fellow of the ASEAN Federation 
of Engineering Organisations. His major 
science and technology awards include the 
National Science & Technology Medal, the 
Institute of Physics Singapore’s President’s 
Medal, as well as the International Council  
on Systems Engineering’s Pioneer Award.  
In addition, Prof Lui is the recipient of the 
Lifetime Engineering Achievement Award 
from the Institution of Engineers Singapore, 
the Defence Technology Medal (Outstanding 
Service) from the Ministry of Defence, as well 
as the Aviation Pioneer Award from the 
Singapore Institute of Aviation Engineers.
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